
 

Y6 Open Evening 2021 

Meet the Team! 
#PGSClassof2027 

 

Aim High  Be Determined  Be Brave  Be Supportive  Be Proud 
 

 
 
 
 
 Who are you and 

what do you do? 
 

What is your favourite thing 
about working at PGS? 

 

Can you tell us a fun fact 
about yourself please? 

 

 

I am Mr Teasdale 

and my job at PGS is 

Curriculum Area 
Leader: Computing 

Teaching incredible students 
who go above and beyond 

each day, surprising you with 
their resilience and positive 

attitude when faced with new 
challenges. A highlight is when 

students thank you for the 
lesson. #winning. 

I have a bottom draw full of ties 
in my desk and I lived in 

Florence, Italy for a year as 
part of my university 

placement. 

    

    
    

 

I am Miss 
Cusworth and my 

job at PGS is 

Teacher of 
Computing 

Our core values mean our 
students approach learning 

how to use new technologies 
with confidence and 

enthusiasm. They show 
determination and resilience 
when solving computational 
problems and are incredibly 
supportive of each other, it is 
an absolute privilege to be a 

part of their education! 

I love tech but I'm also very 
creative and make all of my 
own soaps and bath bombs, 
grow veg and love to sow!  

    

    
    

 

I am Mr Stones 

and my job at PGS is 

Teacher of PE, 
Maths and 
Computing 

The great and supportive 
community we have at 

Penistone. Both staff and 
students are friendly, and the 
school atmosphere make it a 

pleasure to teach here.  

I once played in a football 
match that lasted 36 hours  

    

    
    

 

I am Miss 
Fitzpatrick and 

my job at PGS is 

Teacher of 
Computing 

How creative our students are! 
I am never bored at Penistone, 

as the staff are amazing at 
what they do, and students are 

supportive and resilient 
learners. I am incredibly lucky 
to be able to be a part of the 
journey our pupils make from 

Y7 to confident Y11s.  

I love travelling abroad and 
have been to over 8 countries 

and 3 continents!  

 

We are the 

Computing Department! 
Would you like to 
ask us a question? 


